Price Evaluation
Moving-Floor Trailer Repair Services
2026-RFB-0009

Advanced Trailer Sales & Service

California Live Floors Inc.

HD Distribution, Inc.

Transportation Services

West Coast Moving Floors

Stockton, CA

Stockton, CA

West Sacramento, CA

Sacramento, CA

Valley Springs, CA

Line Item Description Qty uom Unit Cost Extended Cost |Unit Cost Extended Cost |Unit Cost Extended Cost |Unit Cost Extended Cost |Unit Cost Extended Cost

Hourly Labor and Travel Rates

1 Regular Hourly Labor Rate for In-Shop Repairs. 150 Hour S 120.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 18,750.00 | $ 170.00 | $ 25,500.00 | $ 185.00 | $ 27,750.00 | $ 140.00 | S 21,000.00

2 Hourly Travel Rate to transport transfer trailers between [60 Hour S = S - S 160.00 | $ 9,600.00 | $ 178.00 | $ 10,680.00 | $ 185.00 | $ 11,100.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 8,400.00
County locations and bidder's shop location.

3 Hourly Labor Rate for Mobile (On-Site) Repair Services. |60 Hour S 120.00 | $ 7,200.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 9,600.00 | $ 210.00 | $ 12,600.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 8,400.00
Parts % Discount or Markup % Markup Extended Cost | % Markup Extended Cost |% Markup Extended Cost |% Markup Extended Cost | % Markup Extended Cost

4 Indicate percentage discount or markup from S 45,000.00 |Each 25.00% S 56,250.00 |20.00% S 54,000.00 |43.00% S 64,350.00 |20.00% S 54,000.00 |0.00% S 45,000.00
manufacturer's (Peerless) list price for parts.
Miscellaneous Charges Unit Cost Extended Cost |Unit Cost Extended Cost |Unit Cost Extended Cost |Unit Cost Extended Cost |Unit Cost Extended Cost

5 Hazardous Waste/Environmental Fee, if applicable. 5 Each No Bid S - S 5.00 | $ 25.00 | No Bid S - S 30.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 250.00

6 Other Fees, if any (Describe in comments field). 1 Each No Bid S - S 3.00 (S 3.00 | No Bid S - S - S - S - S -
Miscellaneous Charges % Markup Extended Cost | % Markup Extended Cost |% Markup Extended Cost |% Markup Extended Cost | % Markup Extended Cost

7 Consumables/Shop Supplies, if applicable (% of labor Each 8.00% S 2,016.00 |2.00% S 567.00 |7.00% S 2,667.00 |3.00% S 1,282.50 |35.00% S 10,290.00
total).
Total of all Bid Items S 83,466.00 S 92,545.00 S 115,797.00 S 109,282.50 S 93,340.00
Risk Assessment Adjustment S 3,496.55 S 3,751.82 S 4,850.96 S 4,725.73 S 3,405.65
5% Local Business Preference S - S - S - S 5,464.13 S -
2% Micro-Business Preference S - S - S - S 2,185.65 S -
Total Bid S 79,969.45 S 88,793.18 $ 110,946.04 S 96,907.00 S 89,934.35

Low Bid




Licenses, Permits & POP

Moving-Floor Trailer Repair Services
2026-RFB-0009

Advanced Trailer

California Live

HD Distribution,

Transportation

West Coast

Sales & Service Floors Inc. Inc. Services, Inc. Moving Floors
Entity status with the California Secretary of |Active Active Active Active Unable to verify
State
Procurement Opportunities Program (POP)
Local Business Preference No No No Yes No
Micro-Business Preference No No No Yes No

Notes:




Risk Assessment Questionnaire Scores

Moving-Floor Trailer Repair Services

2026-RFB-0009

Question #

Max. Pts.

Advanced
Trailer Sales &
Service

California Live
Floors Inc.

HD

Distribution,

Inc.

Transportatio
n Services

West Coast
Moving Floors
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Questionnaire
Max Points
37

37 31 30 31 32 27
Max %
5.00% 4.19% 4.05% 4.19% 4.32% 3.65%
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